T TN IFB PC-130118 Pavement

[ - ; O Pinal County
Malntena_nce Materlails .Supply, Finance Department
Delivery & Application 31 N. Pinal St.
Bldg. A
PINAL*COUNTY P.O. Box 1348

Response Form 1 Florence, AZ 85132

wide open opportunity

Responder Name: Paramount Petroleum Corporation

Responders shall complete the following Response Form, indicating their responses in the spaces provided. Additional pages may
be added so long as they are clearly referenced in the spaces provided.

Acceptability of Responses

Offers that do not include this completed Response Form or that do include an incomplete Response Form or that include a
completed Response Form with unacceptable responses may cause the entire offer to be deemed unacceptable and therefore non-
responsive.

1 Price

Responders shall complete the following pricing information below on the products your company offers which could be
utilized during pavement preservation and maintenance.

1.1 PAVING GRADE ASPHALT - MAG SPEC #711 OR EQUIVALENT

Please provide pricing on paving grade asphalt products. Include description and pricing on any custom blends your company

offers.
Price per Ton Spreader Price | Transport Price Unused Product
Product Name & Description F.O.B Plant per Hour per Hour Disposal Fee
PG 58-22 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
PG 64-16 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
PG 70-10 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
PG 76-16 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ NoBid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ NoBid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

1.2 LIQUID ASPHALT - MAG SPEC #712 OR EQUIVALENT

Please provide pricing on liquid asphalt products. Include description and pricing on any custom blends your company offers.

Price per Ton Spreader Price | Transport Price Unused Product

Product Name & Description F.O.B Plant per Hour per Hour Disposal Fee
MC-30 or equal $ 950.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00

MC-70 or equal $ 810.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00

MC-250 or equal $ 71545 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00

MC-800 or equal $ 690.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00
MC-3000 or equal $ 675.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00

Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ NoBid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
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1.3 EMULSIFIED ASPHALT - MAG SPEC #713 OR EQUIVALENT

Please provide pricing on emulsified asphalt products. Include description and pricing on any custom blends your company

offers.
Price per Ton Spreader Price | Transport Price Unused Product

Product Name & Description F.0.B Plant per Hour per Hour Disposal Fee
RS-1 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
RS-2H or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
MS-1 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
MS-2 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
MS-2h or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
S$S-1 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ 75.00
8S-1h or equal $ 490.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00
QSH or equal $ 510.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00
CRS-1 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ 75.00
CRS-2h or equal $ 505.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00
CRS-2P (Polymer modified) or
equal Polymer: 3% $ 545.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00
CMS-2 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
CMS-2h or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
CSS-1 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
CSS-1h or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
PMCQS-1h or equal $ 580.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

1.4 ASPHALT RUBBER - MAG SPEC #717 OR EQUIVALENT

Please provide pricing on asphalt rubber products. Include description and pricing on any custom blends your company offers.

Price per Ton Spreader Price | Transport Price Unused Product

Product Name & Description F.O.B Plant per Hour per Hour Disposal Fee

Type 1 — PG 64-16 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

Type 2 — PG 58-22 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

Type 3 — PG 52-28 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
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1.5 PRESERVATIVE SEAL FOR ASPHALT CONCRETE - MAG SPEC #718 OR EQUIVALENT

Please provide pricing on products used for preservative seal for asphalt concrete. Include description and pricing on any
custom blends your company offers

. Price per Ton Spreader Price | Transport Price Unused Product
Product Name & Description F.O.B Plant per Hour per Hour Disposal Fee
Type A or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Type B or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ NoBid $ No Bid
Type C or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Type D or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

1.6 OTHER CUSTOM BLENDS

Please provide information on other products your company offers which could be utilized during pavement preservation and
maintenance.

Product Name & Purpose or Based on Price per Ton Spreader Transport Unused Product
Description Application MAG spec F.0.B. Plant Price per Hour | Price per Hour Disposal Fee
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2 Capacity of Offeror

2.1. Responder shall provide:
2.1.1 Name, Title and email address of Primary Responder
Rick Terry, Southwest Sales & Marketing Manager
Email: rterry@ppcla.com
2.1.2  Address, phone, fax and email address of Primary Servicing Office
1935 West McDowell Road, Phoenix, AZ 85009
Tel: 602-252-3061 Fax: 602-257-8831 Email: phxdispatch@ppcla.com

o . 3 Available online at
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