% Pinal County
Finance Dgpartment
Offer and Acceptance 31 N. Pinal St.

Bldg. A
PINALCOUNTY [ P.O. Box 1348
wide open opportunity Florence, AZ 85132

OFFER AND ACCEPTANCE FORM
TO PINAL COUNTY:

The undersigned hereby offers and agrees to furnish the material, service, or construction in compliance with all terms,
conditions, specifications, and amendments in the Solicitation.
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uthorized Slgnature (/4 Title
/?'aé [enky Julyll 2013
Printed Name Date
m ol eum RO . lplh- L8> 204/
Company Name Telephone

1925 0. M. Bowe!l Ld. /hoen. « k2 83009

Address i City, State, Z|p

For clarification of this offer, contact:

Name: gonmé #l" /1 Phone: éé}’ 28 r-20L 1 Fax: 00)' ’22 57 yy"a/
Email: bAA// @Pﬂﬂrla Com

ACCEPTANCE OF OFFER
(For Pinal County Use Only)

The offer is hereby accepted and the Responder is now bound to sell or provide the materials, services, or
construction as indicated by the Purchase Order or Notice of Award and based upon the solicitation, including all
terms, conditions, specifications, amendments, etc. and the Offer as accepted by Pinal County.

The contract is for:

This contract shall henceforth be referenced to as Contract No. __130118 . The Offeror is cautioned not to

commence any billable work or to provide any material or service under this contract until Offeror receives an
executed purchase order or notice to proceed.

Awarded this I dayof AMuS\’

&\%gbm_&-_wr_ ¢ J\cu rman
Narhe (Print) Title
Approved as to form: ﬂ A

“—Pinal Cdlinty Attorney's Office

Solicitation No: PC-130118 L Available online at Page 26 of 28

ttp://pinalcountyaz.gov/Departments/Finance/Pages/BidsProposals.aspx



Bldg. A
PINAL-COUNTY P.O. Box 1348
wide open opportunity Florence, AZ 85132

@ Pinal County
Finance Department
Offer and Acceptance 31 N. Pinal St

OFFER AND ACCEPTANCE FORM - Page 2

By signing the previous page of the Offer and Acceptance Form, Responder certifies:

A
B.

C.

The submission of the bid did not involve collusion or other anti-competitive practices.

The Responder shall not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment in violation of Federal
Executive Order 11246.

The Responder has not given, offered to give, nor intends to give at any time hereafter, any economic opportunity,
future employment, gift, loan, gratuity, special discount, trip, favor, or service to a public servant in connection with the
Submittal.

The Responder certifies that it complies with Executive Order 12549 related to Federal Government Debarment and
Suspension (see 4-7)

The Responder certifies that the individual signing the bid is an authorized agent for the Responder and has the
authority to bind them to the contract.
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O rIGINAL

Pinal County

Finance Department

31 N. Pinal St., Building A
Florence, AZ 85132

Solicitation No.: PC-130118
Due: July 16, 2013 2:00 PM Arizona Time

Submitted by:

Paramount Petroleum Corporation
1935 W. McDowell Rd
Phoenix, AZ 85009

Rick Terry

Southwest Sales & Marketing Manger
Tel: 602-252-3061

Fax: 602-257-8831

Email: rterry@ppcla.com

For Questions, please contact:

Bonnie Hall

Marketing Coordinator
Tel: 602-252-3061

Fax: 602-257-8831
Email: bhall@ppcla.com

1935 West McDowell Road
Phoenix, AZ 85009
Phone: (602) 252-3061

AE@NLUSA
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% Pinal County
Addendum Finance Department
31 N. Pinal St.
PINAL<COUNTY Acknowledgement Bldg. A
wide open opporiunity P.O. Box 1348
Form Florence, AZ 85132

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM

Solicitation Addendums are posted on the Pinal County website at the following address:
http://pinalcountyaz.gov/Departments/Finance/Pages/BidsProposals.aspx . It is the responsibility of the Responder to periodically
check this website for any Solicitation Addendum.

This page is used to acknowledge any and all addendums that might be issued. Any addendum issued within five days of the
solicitation due date, will include a new due date to allow for addressing the addendum issues. Your signature indicates that you took
the information provided in the addendums into consideration when providing your complete response.

Please sign and date:

ADDENDUM NO. 1 Acknowledgement

Signature Date
ADDENDUM NO. 2 Acknowledgement

Signature Date
ADDENDUM NO. 3 Acknowledgement

Signature Date

If no addendums were issued, indicate below, sign the form and retumn with your response.

@Mz_/é_«zz@zz_&zpﬂaﬁ on

Firm
Authorized Signature 0

Solicitation No: PC-130118 L Available online at Page 23 of 28
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@ Pinal County
. Finance Dgpanment
Responder’s Checklist 31 N. Pinal St

Bldg. A
PINAL<COUNTY P.O. Box 1348
wide apen opportunity Florence, AZ 85132
RESPONDERS CHECKLIST
Yes/No

Did you sign your Offer sheet?
See page 25 & 26 of this solicitation. l/e S
Did you acknowledge all addendums, if any?
See page 22. Any addendums would be posted on the Pinal County website on the Bids/Proposals page of
the Finance/Purchasing Department. ,/e S

Did you complete all required Response Forms?

Any Response forms would be posted on the Pinal County website on the Bids/Proposals page of the
Finance/Purchasing Department.

TAS

Did you include your W-9 Form?

See page 23 of this solicitation.

Jes

Did you include any necessary attachments?

Ve

Is the outside of your sealed submittal marked with the Solicitation #, Due Date and Time?

See page 1 for this information.

Ves

Did you include one original and the required number of copies?

See page 1 for the quantity.

Did you follow the order for submissions of documents?

See Section 3.4 — Offer format in the Special Instructions of this solicitation.

'/cS

Did you include proof of insurance(s) if requested?

No ¥

*U,'H p/&all‘d& I_-r;WCO/

Solicitation No: PC-130118 L Available online at
ttp://pinalcountyaz.gov/Departments/Finance/Pages/BidsProposals.aspx
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T TN IFB PC-130118 Pavement

[ - ; O Pinal County
Malntena_nce Materlails .Supply, Finance Department
Delivery & Application 31 N. Pinal St.
Bldg. A
PINAL*COUNTY P.O. Box 1348

Response Form 1 Florence, AZ 85132

wide open opportunity

Responder Name: Paramount Petroleum Corporation

Responders shall complete the following Response Form, indicating their responses in the spaces provided. Additional pages may
be added so long as they are clearly referenced in the spaces provided.

Acceptability of Responses

Offers that do not include this completed Response Form or that do include an incomplete Response Form or that include a
completed Response Form with unacceptable responses may cause the entire offer to be deemed unacceptable and therefore non-
responsive.

1 Price

Responders shall complete the following pricing information below on the products your company offers which could be
utilized during pavement preservation and maintenance.

1.1 PAVING GRADE ASPHALT - MAG SPEC #711 OR EQUIVALENT

Please provide pricing on paving grade asphalt products. Include description and pricing on any custom blends your company

offers.
Price per Ton Spreader Price | Transport Price Unused Product
Product Name & Description F.O.B Plant per Hour per Hour Disposal Fee
PG 58-22 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
PG 64-16 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
PG 70-10 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
PG 76-16 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ NoBid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ NoBid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

1.2 LIQUID ASPHALT - MAG SPEC #712 OR EQUIVALENT

Please provide pricing on liquid asphalt products. Include description and pricing on any custom blends your company offers.

Price per Ton Spreader Price | Transport Price Unused Product

Product Name & Description F.O.B Plant per Hour per Hour Disposal Fee
MC-30 or equal $ 950.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00

MC-70 or equal $ 810.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00

MC-250 or equal $ 71545 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00

MC-800 or equal $ 690.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00
MC-3000 or equal $ 675.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00

Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ NoBid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

Solicitation No: PC-130118 lhttp://pinalcountyaz.gov/Desgrat‘::maet::tesfg:lr:r;ﬁ:;/Pages/BidsProposals.aspx Page 1 of 4



IFB PC-130118 Pavement .
Maintenance Materials — Supply, Fina‘:g:' &%L::ttym ot

Delivery & Application 31 N. Pinal St.

Bldg. A
P.O. Box 1348
Florence, AZ 85132

PINAL-COUNTY

wide open opportunity Response Form 1

1.3 EMULSIFIED ASPHALT - MAG SPEC #713 OR EQUIVALENT

Please provide pricing on emulsified asphalt products. Include description and pricing on any custom blends your company

offers.
Price per Ton Spreader Price | Transport Price Unused Product

Product Name & Description F.0.B Plant per Hour per Hour Disposal Fee
RS-1 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
RS-2H or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
MS-1 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
MS-2 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
MS-2h or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
S$S-1 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ 75.00
8S-1h or equal $ 490.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00
QSH or equal $ 510.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00
CRS-1 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ 75.00
CRS-2h or equal $ 505.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00
CRS-2P (Polymer modified) or
equal Polymer: 3% $ 545.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00
CMS-2 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
CMS-2h or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
CSS-1 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
CSS-1h or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
PMCQS-1h or equal $ 580.45 $ 165.00 $ 85.00 $ 75.00
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

1.4 ASPHALT RUBBER - MAG SPEC #717 OR EQUIVALENT

Please provide pricing on asphalt rubber products. Include description and pricing on any custom blends your company offers.

Price per Ton Spreader Price | Transport Price Unused Product

Product Name & Description F.O.B Plant per Hour per Hour Disposal Fee

Type 1 — PG 64-16 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

Type 2 — PG 58-22 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

Type 3 — PG 52-28 or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Solicitation No: PC-130118 ‘http://pinalcountyaz.gov/De;?avr?rl:\aet:?sfglr:giglpages/BidsProposals.aspx Page 2 of 4



N IFB PC-130118 Pavement

(" Maintenance Materials — Supply, Fin a’?g:'&%‘;’:t?'nem
Delivery & Application 31 N. Pinal St.
Bldg. A

PINAL COUNTY
wide open opportunity

P.O. Box 1348

ReSponse Form 1 Florence, AZ 85132

1.5 PRESERVATIVE SEAL FOR ASPHALT CONCRETE - MAG SPEC #718 OR EQUIVALENT

Please provide pricing on products used for preservative seal for asphalt concrete. Include description and pricing on any
custom blends your company offers

. Price per Ton Spreader Price | Transport Price Unused Product
Product Name & Description F.O.B Plant per Hour per Hour Disposal Fee
Type A or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Type B or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ NoBid $ No Bid
Type C or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Type D or equal $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid
Custom Blend $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid

1.6 OTHER CUSTOM BLENDS

Please provide information on other products your company offers which could be utilized during pavement preservation and
maintenance.

Product Name & Purpose or Based on Price per Ton Spreader Transport Unused Product
Description Application MAG spec F.0.B. Plant Price per Hour | Price per Hour Disposal Fee
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2 Capacity of Offeror

2.1. Responder shall provide:
2.1.1 Name, Title and email address of Primary Responder
Rick Terry, Southwest Sales & Marketing Manager
Email: rterry@ppcla.com
2.1.2  Address, phone, fax and email address of Primary Servicing Office
1935 West McDowell Road, Phoenix, AZ 85009
Tel: 602-252-3061 Fax: 602-257-8831 Email: phxdispatch@ppcla.com

o . 3 Available online at
Solicitation No: PC-130118 Lttp://pinalcountyaz.gov/Departments/Finance/Pages/BidsProposals.aspx Page 3 of 4



N IFB PC-130118 Pavement _
- Maintenance Materials — Supply, Fina?g:'[;‘;“a':t%e "
Delivery & Application 31 N. Pinal St.
Bldg. A
PINAL*COUNTY P.O. Box 1348
wide open opportunity Response Form 1 Florence, AZ 85132

2.2 Responder shall provide general background information regarding their company. Responder shall describe their

overall experience in the industry relative to the services offered.

Paramount Petroleum Corporation is a Liquid Asphalt Supplier and current supplier of CRS-2P to the County. For this project,
Cactus Transport, Inc. will be subcontracted by Paramount Petroleum Corporation to handle the distribution portion of this
contract, providing spreader and transport trucks.

23 Responder shall indicate if they will comply with the general and specific requirements as described in the
Statement of Work.
Section Requirement Comply?
Responder shall indicate if they will procure all permits and
212 licenses required to fulfill the contract, and provide copies of
current permits or licenses with their response. Yes _X _No
213 Responder shall indicate if they shall perform at least fifty-one
o percent (51%) of the value of each project. Yes No _X
31.1 Responder shall indicate if they will provide equipment and
T operator 72 hours from the date of notification by Pinal County. | Yes _X__No
31.2 Responder shall indicate if they will deliver material on 24
o hours notice to any section of Pinal County. Yes _X__No
Responder shall indicate if they will furnish a one man
bituminous distributor truck with a capacity of not less than
313 1,300 gallons that complies with ADOT Standard
Specifications for Road And Bridge Construction, Section 404,
latest edition and revision. Yes X __No
31.4 Responder shall indicate if they have storage facilities in the
o Phoenix or Tucson area Yes _X _No
Certified scale and weighmaster Yes _X__ No
Phoenix Tucson Other
315 Responder shall provide hot water for truck flushing purposes. | Yes _X No
Price for truck flushing: $__1,000.00 per _Flush
316 Responder shall provide testing, at its own cost, when
o determined necessary by Pinal County Yes _X _ No
3.2 Responder shall comply with the pricing requirements. Yes _X__No

Solicitation No: PC-130118 Ih

Available online at

ttp://pinalcountyaz.gov/Departments/Finance/Pages/BidsProposals.aspx

Page 4 of 4




IMPORTANT NOTICE
YOU MUST:

REPORT DISASSOCIATION OF QUALIFYING PARTY IN WRITING WITHIN 15 DAYS.

[SEE AR.S. § 32-1154(A)(19) AND § 32-1151.01)

REPORT A CHANGE OF ADDRESS IN WRITING WITHIN 30 DAYS.

[SEEARS. § 32-1151(B)(1)}

REPORT ANY TRANSFER OF OWNERSHIP OF 50% OR MORE IMMEDIATELY.
[SEEARS. § 32-1151.01)

REPORT ANY CHANGE OF LEGAL ENTITY SUCH AS ANY CHANGE IN THE
OWNERSHIP IN SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP OR CHANGE OF A PARTNER IN A
PARTNERSHIP OR THE CREATION OF A NEW CORPORATE ENTITY.

.[SEE RULE-R-4:9-110}

-Paramount Petroleum Corporation

Paramount Petroleum Corporation
1935 W Mcdowell Rd
Phoenix, AZ 85009-3024

THIS IS YOUR IDENTIFICATION CARD
DO NOT DESTROY

¥

LICENSE EFFECTIVE THRéUGH: 03/31/2015
STATE OF ARIZONA i
Registrar of Contractors CERTIFIES THAT

Paramount Petroleum Corporation

‘CONTRACTORS LICENSE NO 121797 cLass AE
COMMERCIAL APPLICATION OF BITUMINOUS MATERIAL

(S anQ 7 P2 B0

DIRECTOR, ARIZONA REGISTRAR OF CONTRACTORS

THIS CARD MUST BE
PRESENTED UPON DEMAND
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ARIZONA DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE

L T TR R

LICENSE & REGISTRATION SECTION
1600 WEST MONROE MUST BE_
PHOENIX, ARIZONA 85007-2650 DISPLAYED IN A
CONSPICUDUS PLACE
NSACTION PRIVILE G-E T A X L I CENSE L
. —=NOT TRANSFERABLE-
E IS ISSUED TO THE BUSINESS NAMED BELOW FOR THE ADDRESS SHOWN. P
Y LAW, MAY NOT BE TRANSFERRKRED FROM ONE PERSON TO ANOTHER NOR CAN
NSFERRED FROM ONE LOCATION TO ANOTHERe ARIZONA LAW REQUIRES L 1I-
NOTIFY THE DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE IF THERE IS A CHANGE IN BUSINESS
NAME , LDOCATIONs MAILING ADDRESS OR OWNERSHIP. IN ADDITIONy WHEN
DISCONTINUED OR BUSINESS LOCATION CHANGES AND_A NEW LICENSE IS
S LICENSt MUST BE RETURNED TO IHE ARIZONA DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE. f
£ LISTED BELOW 1S LTCENSED TO CONDUCT BUSINESS UPON THE CONDITION !
ARE PAID TO THE ARIZDONA DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE AS ACCRUED UNDER b
OF ARS TITLE 42, CHAPTER 8,4 ARTICLE 1. i
]
f
ALL communications
and Reports MUST
07-379270—-HW ‘ REFER to this
’ LICENSE NO. i
PARAMOUNT PETROLEUM CORP '
14700 DODWMEY AVE
PARAMOUNTY CA 90723 17 BUSINESS CODE
09-01-89 EFFECTIVE DATE
PARAMDUNT PETROLEUM CORP
1935 W MCODOWELL RD
PHOENI X AZ 85009 {REISSUE) 12-18-96 PRINT DATE
—
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